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Obstructed Labour Due to Large Bladder Stone - Case Report 

Kunjal Bathija, Shashank H. Shah 

Dept . Ol>;; . t_:C Cy11. , l~njmuadil fospitnl, Clintkopnr (£), Mumbai-400 077 . . 

J\llr-, AB. 24 yrs old female, G3P2L2 with full term 
pregnancv with previous L.S.C.S. with obstructed labour 
cc1mc with fully dilated cervix since 2 hours in Raja wadi 
ho~p1tal, on 31 ' ' March 1999. 

0 I 1-1: 1 fT. LSCS, for transverse lie, female 3 yrs alive and 
well . 

Later 1 fTND female 1 Yz yrs alive and well. 

On examination - Patient was thin built markedly 
anemic, pulse rate 100imt., B.P 100180 mm of Hg. 
Systemic E>-.amination was normal. 

Per abdomen Examination: 
Midline vertical scar of previous L.S.C.S. seen. 

Uterus- Fu II term. Cephalic, 1 IS'h palpable 3 I 10' I 40", 
acti\'ity f<elal Heart rate -140imin. No scar tenderness. 

P /V examination- Cervix fully dilated and full)' effaced. 
Tense bulging membranes. Vertex presentatiOn, stalion-
0, 7cm x Scm oval shaped large stone fell in tlw bladder. 
Bladder catheterized by foley:. catheter - No Hematuria. 

Management 

Emergency LSCS for previous L.S.C.S with obstructed 
labour done. Abdomen opened in layers. U-V-fo ld of 
peritoneum separated. Bladder pushed down. Baby 
delivered by lower segment uterine incision. Se>-.- Ma lc, 
Birth weight- 2.8 kg cried immediately at birth. Uterine 
incision closed in layers. Bladder stone felt. Bladder 
opened at the dome and smooth walled lamella ted large 
stone removed. Bladder sutured in two layers with 3-0 
vicryl. Suprapubic malecot catheter kept. Patient reported 
of having her plain X-ray of pelvis before the present 
pregnancy. 
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